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Figure 1. Continuous
composting toilet

(Latrine superstructure not shown)

Compost latrines
Composting is the process of
biologically breaking down solid
organic matter to produce a substance
(compost) which is valuable as a
fertilizer  and soil conditioner. Excreta is
mixed with other matter to reduce the
moisture content, adjust the chemical
balance of the mass and improve the
texture.

Given a large enough organic mass and
the presence of oxygen, the breakdown
process will release energy. This energy
will be partly used by the bacteria to
reproduce, and will be partly converted
to heat. If sufficient heat is generated,
the temperature of the mass can rise
enough to kill pathogens. The wastes
generated by a single family are not
enough to support such a large
increase in temperature and, therefore,

the process cannot be relied upon to
destroy pathogenic organisms,
particularly parasitic worms and cysts.
Any latrine based on this process must
contain other features to prevent the
spread of disease. Decomposition can
also take place in the absence of
oxygen (anaerobically). It is slower
and does not produce any rise in
temperature. It may also produce a
strong odour.
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Further information
Franceys, R., Pickford, J. and Reed, R., A Guide to the Development of On-site Sanitation, WHO, Geneva, 1992.
Pickford, John., Low-cost Sanitation: A survey of practical experience, IT Publications, London, 1995.

Biogas
If human excreta is combined with


